Reference: FOI1.4095.20

Subject: Denied annual leave requests

Date of Request: | 25 September 2020

Requested:

1. The number of annual leave requests made by staff which were denied between 1 May and 31
August 2020.

2. The number of annual leave requests denied between 1 May and 31 August 2019.

3. Role of staff member whose annual leave request was denied, e.g. nurse, Agenda for Change
band 5 or above.

Response:

Hywel Dda University Health Board (UHB) regrets to inform you that we do not hold the information
you requested as denied annual leave requests are not recorded centrally on a system which allows
us to report this information.
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