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Reference:   FOI.8009.22 

Subject:    Radiology systems 

Date of Request: 19 January 2022 
 

Requested: 
 
1. What is the main Radiology (RIS/CRIS) system that your Trust/Health Board runs? 
 
2. Who is the supplier of this system? 
 
3. What is the annual cost of the system? 
 
4. How long is the contract for the system, and when does it expire? 
 
5. What is the overall lifetime cost of the system? 
  
6. What is the main Picture Archiving and Communications System (PACS) system that your 

Trust/Health Board runs? 
 
7. Who is the supplier of this system? 
 
8. What is the annual cost of the system? 
 
9. How long is the contract for the system, and when does it expire? 
10. What is the overall lifetime cost of the system? 
  
11. What is the main Pathology (LIMS) system that your Trust/Health Board runs? 
 
12. Who is the supplier of this system? 
 
13. What is the annual cost of the system? 
 
14. How long is the contract for the system, and when does it expire? 
 
15. What is the overall lifetime cost of the system? 
 

Response: 
 
1. Hywel Dda University Health Board (UHB) confirms that the main Radiology system is Radis2. 
 
2. The UHB confirms that this is a national system as part of an All Wales Framework Contact 

managed by NHS Digital Health and Care Wales (DHCW). 
 

3. The UHB confirms that the annual cost of the Radis2 system is £79,113.00. 
 

4. & 5. The UHB does not hold the information requested as it is managed by DHCW via an All 
Wales Framework Contract. Therefore, please re-direct this part of your request to their 
Freedom of Information (FoI) Team in NWIS nwis_foirequest@wales.nhs.uk 
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6. The UHB confirms that the main Picture Archiving and Communications System (PACS) is Fuji 
PACS. 

 
7. The UHB confirms that the supplier of its PACS system is Fuji. 

 
8. The UHB confirms that the annual cost of the PACS system is £780,000.00 

 
9. & 10. The UHB does not hold the information requested as it is managed by DHCW via an All 

Wales Framework Contract. Therefore, please contact the FOI Team in DHCW on the details 
provided above, who may be able to help you further. 

 
11. The UHB confirms that the main Pathology Laboratory Information Management System (LIMS) 

is WLIMS. 
 
12. The UHB confirms that the supplier of its WLIMS system is Inter Systems. 

 
13. The UHB confirms that the annual cost of the WLIMS system is £319,137.00. 

 
14. & 15. The UHB does not hold the information requested as it is managed by DHCW via an All 

Wales Framework Contract Therefore, please contact the FOI Team in DHCW on the details 
provided above, who may be able to help you further.  

 

 


