FOI1.14403 - Attachment 1

1. Hearing assessments

Number of patients |

2. Hearing aid fittings

3. Hearing aid aftercare

4. Hearing aid devices

Name of provider 2018/19 2019/20 2020/21 2021/22 2022/23 2023/24
In-house provider 1 Hywel Dda University Health Board 8,736 9,113 2,918 8,201 9,208 8,435
Outsourced provider 1 Not applicable
Insourced provider 1 Not applicable
Total 8,736 9,113 2,918 8,201 9,208 8,435
Total spending £
Name of provider 2018/19 | 2019/20 | 2020/21 |  2021/22 | 2022/23 | 2023/24
In-house provider 1 Hywel Dda University Health Board Not held - not recorded by activity type
Outsourced provider 1 Not applicable
Insourced provider 1 Not applicable
Total
Number of patients undergoing a fitting
Name of provider 2018/19 2019/20 2020/21 2021/22 2022/23 2023/24
In-house provider 1 Hywel Dda University Health Board 3,866 3,819 1,114 2,813 3,388 3,886
Outsourced provider 1 Not applicable
Insourced provider 1 Not applicable
Total 3,866 3,819 1,114 2,813 3,388 3,886
Total spending £
Name of provider 2018/19 |  2019/20 | 2020/21 |  2021/22 | 2022/23 |  2023/24
In-house provider 1 Hywel Dda University Health Board Not held - not recorded by activity type
Outsourced provider 1 Not applicable
Insourced provider 1 Not applicable
Total
Number of patients with hearing aid aftercare performed
Name of provider 2018/19 2019/20 2020/21 2021/22 2022/23 2023/24
In-house provider 1 Hywel Dda University Health Board 25,683 24,470 23,104 23,807 24,197 26,118
Outsourced provider 1 Not applicable
Insourced provider 1 Not applicable
Total 25,683 24,470 23,104 23,807 24,197 26,118
Total spending £
Name of provider 2018/19 |  2019/20 |  2020/21 |  2021/22 | 2022/23 |  2023/24
In-house provider 1 Hywel Dda University Health Board Not held - not recorded by activity type
Outsourced provider 1 Not applicable
Insourced provider 1 Not applicable
Total
Number of hearing aids delivered to patients
Name of provider 2018/19 |  2019/20 |  2020/21 |  2021/22 | 2022/23 |  2023/24
In-house provider 1 Hywel Dda University Health Board Section 12 exemption applied
Outsourced provider 1 Not applicable
Insourced provider 1 Not applicable
Total
Total spending £
Name of provider 2018/19 |  2019/20 |  2020/21 |  2021/22 | 2022/23 |  2023/24

In-house provider 1

Hywel Dda University Health Board

Not held - not recorded by activity ty,

]

Outsourced provider 1

Not applicable

Insourced provider 1

Not applicable

Total

5. Other Please see Attachment 2.

1.to 4.

Under Section 16, the UHB provides, within the table below, the total non-pay annual costs for its in-house Audiology services, or the 2018/19 to 2022/23 financial years.

Name of provider 2018/19 2019/20 2020/21 2021/22 2022/23 2023/24
In-house provider 1 Hywel Dda University Health Board £745,868.46 | £948,563.60 £546,594.79 | £1,173,561.21 | £749,212.36 | £1,068,107.65
Outsourced provider 1 Not applicable
Insourced provider 1 Not applicable
Total £745,868.46 | £948,563.60 £546,594.79 | £1,173,561.21 | £749,212.36 | £1,068,107.65




