
1.

The UHB has one (1) cath lab.

2.

3.

4.

5.

6. Any trusts within the Health Board considering procuring managed cardiology services

The UHB is not considering procuring managed cardiology services. 

7. 

434

436

Please note:- only one (1) procedure is undertaken, hence only one (1) code being 

provided.
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Calendar year Number

The UHB does not provide private healthcare.

The volumes of private cardiology activity done in these NHS cath labs

Volume of NHS Cath lab and Outpatient Cardiology Activity last three years, broken by 

HRG code

The UHB provides within the table below, the number of procedures undertaken in its cath 

lab, by the Healthcare Resource Group (HRG) code, for the 2022, 2023 and 2024 calendar 

years.

The age of each cath lab

The UHB's cath lab is eight (8) years old.

Any plans to refurbish any of these cath labs

The UHB has no plans to refurbish its cath lab.

HRG code: K634

2022

The total number of cath labs in your Health Board

The number of cath labs are in each Trust

The UHB is not a part of a Trust, the UHB is a part of NHS Wales and is an integrated 

Local Health Board responsible for the planning and provision of primary, community and in 

hospital services, based on the needs of the local community across three (3) counties. 

Please see response to question 1.

2023

510



8.

9.

10.

11.

12.

13. Waiting list time by HRG code for cath lab procedure as of 1
st
 June 2025

14.

15. Waiting list time for Cardiac CT as of 1
st
 June 2025

16. Waiting list time for Cardiac MRI as of 1
st
 June 2025

FOIA.Requests@wales.nhs.uk 

The waiting time for a Coronary Angiogram procedure in a cath lab is currently eight (8) 

weeks. Please see response to question 7 for HRG code.

Waiting list time for New Patient Consultation as of 1
st
 June 2025

The waiting time for a new patient consultation was twenty six (26) weeks, as at 1 June 

2025.

The UHB does not hold the requested information, as the UHB does not undertake Cardiac 

CT or MRI procedures. UHB patients are referred to Swansea Bay University Health Board 

(SBUHB).

We therefore recommend that you redirect these parts of your request to the Freedom of 

Information Team at SBUHB who may be able to help you further. The contact details are 

as follows:

Alternatively, you can contact: FOIA Team, Swansea Bay University Health Board, Health 

Board Headquarters, 1 Talbot Gateway, Port Talbot, SA12 7BR.

Private pricing schedules for all private cardiology activity, cath lab and outpatients

Not applicable. Please see response to question 5.

Profit & Loss last three years for private cath lab activity

Not applicable. Please see response to question 5.

Volume of Private Activity last three years, broken by CSSD code

Please see response to question 5.

Revenue of total NHS cath lab activity, last three years 

The UHB does not hold this information as it does not generate revenue from cath lab 

activity, as it only treats NHS patients.

Revenue of total Private cath lab activity, last three years

Please see response to question 5.

mailto:FOIA.Requests@wales.nhs.uk


17.

18. Waiting list time for ambulatory monitor fitting as of 1
st
 June 2025

19.

20.

21.

22.

The UHB does not outsource cath lab procedures.

Waiting list time for Transthoracic Echo as of 1
st
 June 2025

The waiting list time for a Transthoracic Echocardiogram was eight (8) weeks, as at 1 June 

2025.

The waiting list time for an ambulatory monitor fitting was eight (8) weeks, as at 1 June 

2025.

12 month and 24 month re-do rate of Atrial Fibrillation procedures

12, 24 and 36 month Morbidity and Mortality rate for PCI 

The UHB does not provide Percutaneous Coronary Intervention (PCI) procedures.

The UHB only undertakes Direct Current Cardioversion (DCCV) procedures and no 

patients have had revisions for DCCV during the last 24 months.

All other Atrial Fibrillation revision procedures are undertaken by SBUHB. Please see 

repsonse to question 16 for contact details.

Residual book value of all cardiac assets in current inventory

Any Outsourced work to IS providers and if so, the volumes of activity you outsource, and 

the revenue values of outsourced activity, on a line-by-line basis

Approximately 80% of the UHB’s asset database relates to cardiac devices for the 

treatment and monitoring of cardiac conditions, with an approximate value of £93.34 

million.




