

FOI.20959 - Attachment 1

1. The UHB confirms it does not have its own organised framework and therefore, does not commission any care packages on a spot-purchase basis from providers who are on an organised framework agreement or Dynamic Purchasing System (DPS).

2. Not applicable.

3. Not applicable.

4. The UHB does not hold its own provider list, however, when required, packages are commissioned from agencies listed on the Local Authority (LA) framework. Whilst the UHB is not currently commissioning any care packages on a spot-purchase basis, provided within the table below, is the list of providers included on the LA framework.

Domiciliary Care providers		
Cymer Ofal Care Ltd	MiHomecare Ltd	Newcross Healthcare Solutions Ltd
Mid Wales Home Care Ltd	Codi Care & Support (prev Pobl)	Next Step Nursing Ltd
Western Welsh	Community Interest Care CIC	Nos Da Healthcare
Active Care Group	Croeso Care	Pembrokeshire Care Ltd
Achieve together	CTD Care Services Ltd	People Support Ltd
Affinity Homecare (Aberystwyth) Ltd	Dolwen Domiciliary Agency	Q Care Ltd
Associated Healthcare	Elliot's Hill Care	Quayside Care Ltd
Cadog Homecare Ltd	Gofal Cymunedol Ltd	Value Independence
Care & Independence Domiciliary	Gofal Ystwyth Care	Care at Home Pembrokeshire
Care and Companionship with Emma	Gofalus	Care & Independence
Care in Hand	Harbour Care	The Forge Care Centre
Care Wales Gofal Cymru Ltd	Human Support Group	
Carers Trust Crossroads West Wales	ND Care & Support Ltd	

Care Home providers		
Affalon House	Merton Place	Glanmarlais Care Home
Allt Y Mynydd Care Home	Heathfield Lodge	Llwynhendy Care Home
Blaenos House Nursing Home	Tan Yr Allt House LTD	Parc-Y-Llyn Nursing Home
Ashdale Care Home	Tan Yr Allt Lodge LTD	Park House Court Nursing Home
Awel y Mor Care Centre	Ty Cwm Gwendraeth - Cennen Flats	Plas Cwmcynfelin Care Home
Hafan Y Coed Nursing Home	Ty Mair Nursing Home	Ty Cwm
Plas Y Dderwen Nursing Home	Glangarnant Nursing Home	Cartref Cleddau (Surehaven)
Cilymaenllwyd Care Home	Glasfryn Care Home	Richeston Mill Nursing Home
Belmont Court Nursing Home	Gwernlwyn Care Home	Brain Injury Rehabilitation Trust (BIRT)
Brondesbury Lodge Nursing Home	Glanffrd Care Home	The Meadows Nursing Home
Brooklands Nursing Home	Cwm Gwendraeth Nursing Home	Williamston Nursing Home
Cartref Annwyl Fan Care Home	Ty Cwm Gwendraeth	Woodfield Nursing Home
Parc Wern Nursing Home	Ffordd Newydd	Brunel House Care Home
Fairfield Nursing Home	Torrwood Care Home	

5. The UHB does not hold the information requested as it does not operate its own organised framework agreement or DPS for Domiciliary Care commissioned through Long Term Care (LTC). Where Domiciliary Care support is required, the UHB routinely commissions services through the existing Local Authority (LA) Domiciliary Care Frameworks, operated by Carmarthenshire County Council, Pembrokeshire County Council and Ceredigion County Council. These frameworks provide an approved list of care providers that have met the respective LA's procurement, quality and governance requirements and are used to source care packages on a spot-purchase basis where appropriate. As a result, while the UHB may commission individual packages of care, the providers delivering those services are typically contracted through the LA framework arrangements rather than through a separate UHB managed framework or DPS.

6. The UHB confirms it is not currently commissioning any call-off contracts or other arrangements under the frameworks and DPS detailed in response to question 5.

7. Not applicable.