
1.

Financial year Number

2018/19 901

2019/20 790

2020/21 802

2.

Financial year Number

2018/19 Section 12

2019/20 Section 12

2020/21 542

3.

Financial year Number

2018/19 332

2019/20 358

2020/21 365

4.

Financial year Number

2018/19 13

2019/20 22

2020/21 150

5. Section 40 exemption applied.

6.

opcc@dyfed-powys.pnn.police.uk 

FOI 6282 - Attachment 1

The UHB provides, within the table below, the number of physical assaults on staff, as 

recorded on the UHB’s DATIX Incident Reporting System, during the financial years 

2018/19, 2019/20, and 2020/21.

The UHB provides, within the table below, the number of physical assaults on staff that 

involved medical factors, as recorded on the UHB’s DATIX Incident Reporting System, 

during the financial year 2020/21.

The UHB provides, within the table below, the number of times physical injury was caused 

to staff, as recorded on the UHB’s DATIX Incident Reporting System, during the financial 

years 2018/19, 2019/20, and 2020/21.

The UHB provides, within the table below, the number of times restraint was used 

following a physical assault on staff, as recorded on the UHB’s DATIX Incident Reporting 

System, during the financial years 2018/19, 2019/20, and 2020/21.

The UHB regrets to inform you that it does not hold all of the information requested. 

Instead, Dyfed-Powys Police may be better placed to answer this part of your request for 

information. We therefore recommend that you contact them directly. Contact details are 

set out below:

Office of Police and Crime Commissioner, PO Box 99, Llangunnor, Carmarthen, SA31 

2PF.

or write to:

mailto:opcc@dyfed-powys.pnn.police.uk


7.

Financial year Number

2018/19 Section 12

2019/20 Section 12

2020/21 36

8.

Financial year Number

2018/19 Section 12

2019/20 Section 12

2020/21 58

9.

Financial year Number

2018/19 Section 12

2019/20 Section 12

2020/21 8

10. & 

11.

12.

Period Number

31/03/2019 11,416

31/03/2020 11,373

31/03/2021 12,020

The UHB provides, within the table below, the total number of staff employed, by 

headcount,  as at 31 March 2019, 31 March 2020 and 31 March 2021.

The UHB provides, within the table below, the number civil and administrative sanctions 

applied in relation to physical assaults on staff, as recorded on the UHB’s DATIX Incident 

Reporting System, during the financial year 2020/21.

The UHB provides, within the table below, the number of times intended police action in 

relation to physical assaults on staff was reported to the police and recorded as a charge, 

as recorded on the UHB’s DATIX Incident Reporting System, during the financial year 

2020/21.

The UHB provides, within the table below, the number of times that intended police action, 

in relation to physical assaults on staff, were reported to the police and were recorded as 

verbal warning , as recorded on the UHB’s DATIX Incident Reporting System, during the 

financial year 2020/21.

The UHB does not hold this information. Please re-direct this part of your request to Dyfed-

Powys Police on the contact details provided at question 6.


