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Reference:   FOI.6390.21 

Subject:    COVID-19 vaccination 

Date of Request: 6 July 2021 
 

Requested: 
 
1. Since the start of the Covid-19 vaccination programme, how many members of staff directly 

employed by your health board have received a coronavirus vaccine?  
 
2. Since the start of the Covid-19 vaccination programme, how many members of staff directly 

employed by your health board have refused a coronavirus vaccine?  
 
3. Since the start of the Covid-19 vaccination programme, how many members of staff directly 

employed by your health board in frontline medical roles - i.e. doctors, nurses, consultants, 
anaesthetists, midwifery, occupational & mental health workers - have refused to accept a 
coronavirus vaccine? 

 
Response: 
 
1. Hywel Dda University Health Board has provided within the table overleaf the number of 

employees recorded as having received their first and second COVID-19 vaccination since the 
beginning of the COVID-19 vaccination programme. 

 

1st Vaccination 2nd Vaccination 

10,812 10,167 

 
2. The UHB does not hold this information, as it does not record the number of individuals who 

have refused a COVID-19 vaccine. 
 
3. As indicated in response to question 2, the UHB does not hold this information, as it does not 

record the number of individuals who have refused a COVID-19 vaccine. 
 

 


