Reference:

FOI.17595.25

Subject:

Electronic devices

Date of Request:

18 June 2025

Requested:

I'd like to know the following information for your department over the past year:

Please provide a figure for the number of a) laptops and b) mobile phones that were:

1.

Disposed of or recycled via a third-party contractor.

2. Donated and refurbished for reuse.

3. Lost or stolen.

4. Damaged or otherwise unaccounted for.

Response:

1. Hywel Dda University Health Board (UHB) provides within the table overleaf, the number of
laptops and mobile phones that were disposed of or recycled via a third-party contractor during
the 2024/25 financial year.

Device Number
a. Laptop 400
b. Mobile phone 11

2. The UHB confirms that it does not donate laptops or mobile phones to be refurbished and
reused.

3. The UHB provides within the table below, the number of laptops and mobile phones that were
lost or stolen during the 2024/25 financial year.

Device Number
a. Laptop 2
b. Mobile phone 7
4. The UHB does not hold the requested information as it does not record if a device is damaged.

Damaged devices are included in the disposal figures, which include end of life, damaged and
faulty items. The UHB can confirm that no devices are unaccounted for.
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