Reference: FOI.19897.26

Subject: Gluten-free subsidy cards

Date of Request: | 11 March 2026

Requested:

1. The number of patients who have been in receipt of the gluten-free subsidy card, under the all-
Wales Gluten Free (GF) subsidy card scheme for patients with a diagnosis of coeliac disease
or dermatitis herpetiformis in Wales, between September 15t 2025 and February 28" 20267

2. The total number of eligible patients for the Gluten Free (GF) subsidy card scheme under your
Health Board area.

Response:

Hywel Dda University Health Board (UHB) does not hold information for all Health Boards in NHS
Wales and is therefore unable to provide you with all of the information requested. The UHB can
only provide the information it holds.

Therefore, you would need to request the additional information from the Freedom of Information
Teams in each individual Health Board. Details on the Health Boards in Wales and contact details
for each of them can be found via the following link:

Local Services - NHS Wales

1. The UHB confirms that seventy two (72) of its patients received a Gluten Free (GF) subsidy
card, during the period 1 September 2025 and 28 February 2026.

1. The UHB does not hold the information requested.
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