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Reference:   FOI.6590.21 

Subject:    Mass Testing and Community Testing Centres 

Date of Request: 2 August 2021 

 

Requested: 

1. How many Mass Testing Centre (MTC) providing Covid-19 testing service are available through 

your Health Board and who physically provide this service (full details of contractor, contract 

start and duration including the cost of the contract and future (planned) contracts). How many 

members of public are tested at these facilities (either per day, per week or per month). 

2. How many Community Testing Units (CTUs) providing Covid-19 testing service are available 

through your Health Board and who physically provide this service (full details of contractor, 

contract start and duration including the cost of the contract and future (planned) contracts). 

How many members of public are tested at these facilities (either per day, per week or per 

month). 

3. How many Mobile Testing Unit (MTU) providing Covid-19 testing service are available through 

your Health Board and who physically provide this service (full details of contractor, contract 

start and duration including the cost of the contract and future (planned) contracts). How many 

members of public are tested at these facilities (either per day, per week or per month). 

4. How many Local Test Sites (LTS) providing Covid-19 testing service are available through your 

Health Board and who physically provide this service (full details of contractor, contract start and 

duration including the cost of the contract and future (planned) contracts). How many members 

of public are tested at these facilities (either per day, per week or per month). 

Response: 
 
1. Hywel Dda University Health Board (UHB) confirms that it has one (1) Mass Testing Centre, 

located in Carmarthen which provides drive-through COVID-19 testing and has the capacity to 
deliver five hundred (500) swabs per day. This is delivered and managed by Sodexo. The UHB 
does not hold the Sodexo contract details, as it is managed by the Department of Health and 
Social Care (DHSC). We therefore suggest that you contact them directly for any further 
information you require. Contact details are as follows: freedomofinformation@dhsc.gov.uk 

 
2. The UHB provides, within the table below, details of the UHB’s COVID-19 Community Testing 

Centres (CTU). 
 

Testing 
facility 

location 

Facility details Maximum daily RT-
PCR swabbing 

capacity 

Aberystwyth  Walk-in CTU, managed/delivered by the 
UHB as part of core NHS service. 
Not contracted 

69 

Cwm Cou 68 

Haverfordwest  135 

Llanelli  146 

Carmarthen  Drive-through CTU, managed/delivered by 
the UHB as part of core NHS service. 
Not contracted 

216 
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For clarity, both the MTC and CTU based in Carmarthen are hosted at the same location. 
 

3. The UHB confirms that it has access to five (5) Mobile Testing Units, for use across the UHB’s 
geographical area, with a capacity to deliver two thousand five hundred (2,500) swabs per day, 
provided by Sodexo. The UHB does not hold the Sodexo contract details as it is managed by 
DHSC. As advised in response to question 1, please contact them directly for any further 
information you require, via the email address provided. 
 

4. The UHB confirms that it does not have any Local Test Sites. 
 

 


