
Page 1 of 2 
 

Reference:   FOI.8597.22 

Subject:    Support worker education 

Date of Request: 31 March 2022 
 

Requested: 
 
Please could I have the following information 
  
1. In the calendar year 2018 – 2019: 

How many learners were registered for the level 3 physiotherapy support diploma modules? 
 

2. Of those learners how many completed the modules for which they were registered? 
 

3. How many learners completed all modules and were subsequently awarded the full diploma? 
  
4. In the calendar year 2019-2020: 

How many learners were registered for the level 3 physiotherapy support diploma modules? 
 
5. Of those learners how many completed the modules for which they were registered? 
 
6. How many learners completed all modules and were subsequently awarded the full diploma? 
  
7. In the calendar year 2020 – 2021: 

How many learners were registered for the level 3 physiotherapy support diploma modules? 
 

8. Of those learners how many completed the modules for which they were registered? 
 

9. How many learners completed all modules and were subsequently awarded the full diploma? 
  
10. 2022: 

How many learners are currently registered for the full level 3 diploma 
in physiotherapy support? 

 
11. How many learners are registered for any of the modules in the level 3 in physiotherapy 

support? 
 

Response: 
 
1. Hywel Dda University Health Board (UHB) confirms that sixteen (16) learners were registered 

for the Level 3 Diploma in Physiotherapy Support, during the 2018 calendar year (1 January 
2018 to 31 December 2018). 

 
2. The UHB does not record the information on a modular basis. However, the UHB can confirm 

that of the sixteen (16) that registered for the Level 3 Diploma in Physiotherapy Support, two (2) 
withdrew, during the calendar year. 

 
3. The UHB confirms that fourteen (14) learners completed the Level 3 Diploma in Physiotherapy 

Support, during the calendar year. 
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4. The UHB confirms that no learners registered for the Level 3 Diploma in Physiotherapy Support, 
during the 2019 calendar year (1 January 2019 to 31 December 2019). 

 
5. Not applicable. 

 
6. Not applicable. 

 
7. The UHB confirms that ten (10) learners were registered for the Level 3 Diploma in 

Physiotherapy Support, during the 2020 calendar year (1 January 2020 to 31 December 2020). 
 
8. The UHB does not record the information on a modular basis. 

 
9. The UHB confirms that one (1) of the ten (10) learners has completed the Level 3 Diploma in 

Physiotherapy Support during the 2020 calendar year, with the other nine (9) still in progress. 
 

10. The UHB confirms that twenty (20) learners registered for the Level 3 Diploma in Physiotherapy 
Support, during the 2021 calendar year (1 January 2021 to 31 December 2021). 

 
11. The UHB does not record the information on a modular basis. However, the UHB can confirm 

that learning is still in progress for this cohort. 
 

 


