Reference: FOI.18168.25

Subject: Systems information

Date of Request: | 20 August 2025

Requested:

1.

The name of your Electronic Patient Record (EPR) system?
a. The contract renewal date
b. Confirm if the trust is planning to come out to tender for a new system

The name of your electronic Prescribing and Medicines Administration (ePMA) system?
a. The contract renewal date
b. Confirm if the trust is planning to come out to tender for a new system

The name of your Medicine Decision Support system? (Could also be known as Medicines

Optimisation system)

a. The contract renewal date

b. Confirm if the trust is planning to come out to tender for a new system

c. The name of the person within the trust responsible for decision-making around the use of
this system.

The name of your Cancer Prescribing system? (Could be known as Systemic Anti-Cancer
Therapy Prescribing)

a. The contract renewal date

b. Confirm if the trust is planning to come out to tender for a new system

Response:

1.

Hywel Dda University Health Board (UHB) does not hold the requested information as it does
not have an Electronic Patient Records (EPR) system.

. The UHB confirms that its electronic Prescribing and Medicines Administration (ePMA) system

is Better Meds.

a. The contract renewal date is 31 March 2030.
b. The UHB confirms that it is not planning to tender for a new system.

. The UHB confirms that its Medicine Decision Support system is ScriptSwitch.

a. - c¢. The UHB does not hold the requested information as the system is managed by the
Procurement team in Aneurin Bevan University Health Board (ABUHB). We therefore
recommend that you redirect this part of your request to the Freedom of Information Team
in ABUHB, who may be able to help you with your enquiry. Contact details are as follows:

FOIL.ABB@wales.nhs.uk or alternatively in writing to: Freedom of Information, Aneurin Bevan
University Health Board, Headquarters, St Cadoc’s Hospital, Lodge Road, Caerleon, NP18
3XQ

The UHB confirms that its Cancer Prescribing system is ChemoCare.
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a. & b. The UHB does not hold the requested information as the system is hosted by
Swansea Bay University Health Board (SBUHB). We therefore recommend that you
redirect this part of your request to the Freedom of Information Team at SBUHB who may
be able to help you further. Contact details are as follows:

FOIA.Requests@wales.nhs.uk or alternatively, you can contact: FOIA Team, Swansea Bay

University Health Board, Health Board Headquarters, 1 Talbot Gateway, Port Talbot, SA12
7BR.
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