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Reference:   FOI.1600.19 

Subject:    Underperformance dental contracts 

Date of Request: 23 September 2019 
 

Requested and response: 
 
1. The monies clawed back from NHS primary care dental contracts due to underperformance for 

the year 2018/2019. 

 

During the 2018/19 financial year Hywel Dda University Health Board (UHB) clawed back 

£1,022,162.74 from NHS primary care dental contracts due to underperformance. 

 

2. The monies handed back from NHS primary care dental contracts for the year 2018/2019. 

 

The UHB does not hold this information as negotiations on hand backs are still underway. 
 
3. The number of practices facing claw back from NHS primary care dental contracts due to 

underperformance for the year 2018/2019. 

 
The UHB has 19 NHS primary care dental practices facing clawbacks from their contracts due 

to underperformance in the 2018/19 financial year. 

 
4. The number of practices handing back NHS primary care dental contracts for the year 

2018/2019. 

 

The UHB does not hold this information as negotiations on hand backs are still underway. 

 

5. The location (as precise as possible) of the practices facing claw back from NHS primary care 

dental contracts due to underperformance for the year 2018/2019. 

 

The practices facing claw back are based in the following locations: 

 

 Carmarthenshire central 

 Carmarthenshire East 

 South Ceredigion 

 North Ceredigion 

 
6. The location (as precise as possible) of the practices handing back NHS primary care dental 

contracts for the year 2018/2019. 

Not applicable. 

 


