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Reference:   EIR.17447.25 

Subject:    Water and sewage usage 

Date of Request: 29 May 2025 

 

Requested: 
 
1. I am looking to obtain both daily water usages (cubic metres) and daily sewage volumes (cubic 

metres) for the following 7 hospital sites, over the following 3 week periods: 
 
a. University Hospital Llandough - Cardiff and Vale University Health Board 
b. Morriston Hospital - Swansea Bay University Health Board 
c. Bronglais Hospital - Hywel Dda University Health Board 
d. Ysbyty Glan Clwyd Hospital - Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board 
e. Ysbyty Gwynedd Hospital - Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board 
f. Wrexham Maelor Hospital - Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board 
g. Royal Glamorgan Hospital - Cwm Taf Morgannwg University Health Board 

 

• May 14 - 20, 2023 

• June 11-17, 2023 

• July 9-15, 2023 
 
2. I am also looking to obtain both daily water usages (cubic metres) and daily sewage volumes 

(cubic metres) for the following 3 hospital sites, over the following 3 week periods: 
 

a. Ysbyty Glan Clwyd Hospital - Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board  
b. Ysbyty Gwynedd Hospital - Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board 
c. Wrexham Maelor Hospital - Betsi Cadwaladr University Health Board 

 

• December 10-16, 2023 

• January 7-13, 2024 

• February 4-10, 2024 
 
If daily water usages and daily sewage volumes are not available, monthly volumes would be 
acceptable, or annual volumes (only if this is all that is available). If an annual volume is provided, 
please be clear on the dates this period covers (i.e., calendar year, or financial year with 
corresponding dates). 
 
Response: 
 
Hywel Dda University Health Board (UHB) does not hold information for all Health Boards in NHS 
Wales and is therefore unable to provide you with all of the information requested. The UHB can 
only provide the information it holds. 
 
Therefore, you would need to request the additional information from the Freedom of Information 
Teams in each individual Health Board. Details on the Health Boards in Wales and contact details 
for each of them can be found via the following link: 
 
Local Services - NHS Wales 
 

https://www.nhs.wales/hpb/local-services/


Page 2 of 2 
 

However, in response to question 1c, the UHB provides within Attachment 1, its water consumption 
for Bronglais General Hospital (BGH) in cubic metre per hour (m3/h), as measured by Welsh 
Water’s 15-minute automated logger, for the three (3) periods requested. 

 
The UHB does not hold the sewage volumes, as discharges are not metered. However, the sewage 
discharge is deemed by Welsh Water to be 82% of the water consumption volume. 
 

 


